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Starters
Jalapeno Poppers 5 Breaded jalapenos stuffed with cream cheese; served 
with Ranch dressing 

Deep Fried Pickles 5 golden fried breaded dill pickle spears served with 
Ranch dressing 

Mozzarella Sticks 5 Italian bread crumbed mozzarella sticks served piping 
hot with Ranch dressing or marinara sauce 

Onion Rings Breaded and fried onion rings served with chipotle aioli

Fries Tossed with Lowry’s seasoning salt and served with garlic aioli

Cheesy Bruschetta Bread Baguette with garlic butter, house made 
Bruschetta, mozzarella cheese and topped with a Balsamic reduction 

Griff’s Poutine Fries and cheese curds covered in vegetarian gravy

Chicken Fingers and Fries 4 Chicken Fingers served with your choice of 
plum, bbq or honey garlic as well as fries and our garlic aioli

Pool Hall Platter 3 pcs each of jalapeno poppers, dill pickle spears, 
mozzarella sticks, garlic wedges, 2 chicken fingers and plum sauce, fries and 
garlic aioli and Ranch 

On the Lighter Side
Soup of the Day Please ask your server for details

Cheesy Chili and Garlic Bread Beef, corn, peppers, beans, adobo and 
tomatoes stewed together and topped with melted cheese, sour cream and 
green onions; served with toasted garlic bread  wedges

House Salad Mixed greens, cucumber, pickled red onion and tomatoes 
served with balsamic dressing

Caesar Salad Crisp Romaine lettuce, house made croutons and Caesar 
dressing, bacon and   parmesan topped with a lemon wedge
Add Grilled Chicken, Peppers and Onions 4 
Add Chicken 5
  
Green Cobb Salad Mixed Greens, avocado, pickled red onions, bacon bits, 
tomatoes and a hard boiled  egg served cobb style with a side of our Green 
Goddess dressing
Add Chicken 5
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The Main Event
Served with a side of Fries or House Salad

Grilled Cheese  Melted cheese between garlic buttered bread; served with 
garlic aioli
Add bacon 2.5

BLT Crispy bacon, lettuce and tomato stacked between toast and topped 
with garlic aioli

Buttermilk Fried Chicken Sandwich Seasoned, breaded and fried chicken 
breast with chipotle aioli, pickles and lettuce on a brioche bun

House Made Beef Burger 4 oz of lightly seasoned medium ground beef on 
a garlic buttered brioche bun with our special sauce, lettuce, tomato, pickle 
and onion
 Add Cheese 1.5
 Add Grilled Peppers and Onions 1.5

Cheddar and Bacon Burger Griff’s Burger topped with bacon and melted 
cheese and all the fixins

Steak Sandwich NY Striploin grilled and sliced then topped with sauteed 
onions, peppers and melted  cheese and garlic aioli; served on a baguette

Caesar Wrap Crisp romaine lettuce, house made croutons and Caesar 
dressing, bacon and parmesan rolled into a warm tortilla

Loaded Cesar Wrap Grilled chicken, pepper and onions are added to our 
classic Caesar Wrap

Falafel Burger Our Chickpea based patty topped with fresh cilantro, pickled 
red onion, garlic aioli and lettuce on your choice of a garlic butter brioche 
bun or tortilla
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Sides
Onion Rings
Caesar Salad
House Salad
Fries
Veggie Gravy

Coffee or Tea
Juices 
Orange, Cranberry

Chocolate Milk
Fountain Drinks 
Pop, Iced Tea

Beverages
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